RECORD OF BIDS

SR 240 / EDISON STREET - WB RAMP SIGNAL (RE-AD)
10Y014
BID OPEN DATE: September 8, 2010

APPARENT
LOW BIDDER

Sierra Electric, Inc.

APPARENT
2ND LOW

McCandlish Electric, Inc.,

APPARENT
3RD LOW

Knobel's Electric, Inc.

UNIT ENGINEERS PO Box 2345 3014 G.S. Center Rd Ste D 801 Tennant Ln
ITEM # ITEM DESCRIPTION MEASURE ESTIMATE Pasco, WA Wenatchee, WA Yakima, WA
1 EDISON STREET - WB RAMP SIGNAL L.S. S 43,949.00 -6.88% S 40,925.00 57.00% S 69,000.00 58.21% S 69,530.00

CONTRACT TOTAL S 43,949.00

-6.88% S 40,925.00

57.00% S 69,000.00

58.21% $ 69,530.00




RECORD OF BIDS

SR 240 / EDISON STREET - WB RAMP SIGNAL (RE-AD)
10Y014
BID OPEN DATE: September 8, 2010

APPARENT APPARENT
4TH LOW 5TH LOW
Colvico, Inc. J & M Electric, Inc.
UNIT ENGINEERS PO Box 2682 500 S Lasco Ln Ste 224
ITEM # ITEM DESCRIPTION MEASURE ESTIMATE Spokane, WA Moses Lake, WA
1 EDISON STREET - WB RAMP SIGNAL L.S. S 43,949.00 NO BID NO BID
CONTRACT TOTAL S 43,949.00 NO BID NO BID




